
50 Camping Riddles

1. The more you take, the more you leave behind. What
am I?

Answer: Footsteps.

2. I'm light as a feather, yet the strongest person can't hold
me for more than five minutes. What am I?

Answer: Breath.

3. I can be cracked, made, told, and played. What am I?

Answer: A joke.

4. I have branches, but no fruit, trunk or leaves. What am
I?

Answer: A bank.

5. I'm not a cat or a moon, yet I have nine lives. I light up
the night and flicker around. What am I?

Answer: A campfire.



6. I am taken from a mine, and shut up in a wooden case,
from which I am never released, and yet I am used by
almost every person. What am I?

Answer: Pencil lead.

7. I fly without wings, I cry without eyes. Whenever I go,
darkness flies. What am I?

Answer: Cloud.

8. What walks on four legs in the morning, two legs at
noon, and three legs in the evening?

Answer: A human (as a baby, adult, and elder with a
cane).

9. I'm the highlight of many nights, but I'm not a star. I can
be full, but I'm never overweight. What am I?

Answer: The moon.

10. I speak without a mouth and hear without ears. I have
no body, but I come alive with wind. What am I?

Answer: An echo.

11. I'm not a bird, but I can fly through the trees. I'm not a
fruit, but I can be colorful. What am I?



Answer: A leaf.

13. I run, but I have no legs. I carry lots of things, but I
have no arms. What am I?

Answer: A river.

14. I have keys but no locks. I have space but no room.
You can enter, but you can't go outside. What am I?

Answer: A keyboard (think of portable devices during
camping).

15. Bright like diamonds, high in the sky, but I'm not a star.
What am I?

Answer: Fireflies.

16. I start with a 'T', end with a 'T', and I have 'T' in me.
What am I?

Answer: A teapot.

17. Green or brown, I can be seen hanging around trees,
but I'm not a leaf. What am I?

Answer: A pinecone.

18. I'm full of holes, but I can still hold water. What am I?



Answer: A sponge.

19. I sing to the night but have no voice. I can be heard,
though I'm not a radio. What am I?

Answer: A cricket.

20. You see me once in June, twice in November, but not
at all in May. What am I?

Answer: The letter 'E'.

21. I'm not alive, but I grow; I don't have lungs, but I need
air; I don't have a mouth, and water kills me. What am I?

Answer: Fire.

22. I'm often seen at night, but by day I disappear, not a
star or a planet, but I bring much cheer. What am I?

Answer: A campfire spark.

23. You'll find me in a campsite, but I'm not a tent. I'm
where you may cook, but I'm not a fire. What am I?"

Answer: A grill.

24. I have cities, but no houses. I have mountains, but no
trees. I have water, but no fish. What am I?



Answer: A map.

25. I am not a snake, but I slither around. I can be long or
short, and am often found on the ground. What am I?"

Answer: A rope.

26. Each night I come without being fetched. By day I am
lost without being stolen. What am I?

Answer: Stars.

27. I go in dry and come out wet, the longer I'm in, the
stronger I get. What am I?

Answer: A tea bag.

28. I'm always hungry and must be fed, the finger I touch
will soon turn red. What am I?

Answer: Fire.

29. I am tall when young, and short when I'm old. What am
I?

Answer: A candle.

30. I can wake you up or put you to sleep. I can be
adjusted but not switched off. What am I?



Answer: The sun.

Funny Riddles for Camping

31. Why don't secrets last long in a campsite?

Answer: Because the tents can't keep things under wraps!

32. What do you call a bear with no teeth?

Answer: A gummy bear!

33. Why did the sleeping bag get a promotion?

Answer: Because it had a lot of fill power!

34. Why can't you trust what a fire says?

Answer: Because it's always full of blazes!

35. What kind of tree fits in your hand?

Answer: A palm tree!

36. Why don't mummies go camping?

Answer: They're afraid they might relax and unwind!

37. Why did the flashlight sit down?

Answer: Because it was tired of being turned on!



38. What did one campfire say to the other?

Answer: Wanna go out tonight?

39. Why do mountains make terrible jokes?

Answer: Because they're too hill-arious!

40. Why did the tent get a job?

Answer: Because it wanted to pitch in!

41. Why can't you give Elsa from Frozen a balloon?

Answer: Because she will let it go!

42. Why did the camper bring a baseball bat to his tent?

Answer: To hit the hay!

43. What do you call a bear with no socks on?

Answer: Bare-foot!

44. Why did the star go to school?

Answer: To get a little brighter!

45. Why don't ants get sick?

Answer: Because they have little anty-bodies!



46. What's a tree's favorite drink?

Answer: Root beer!

47. What do you use to cut a Roman Emperor’s hair?

Answer: Caesar scissors!

48. Why did the pine tree get in trouble?

Answer: Because it was being knotty!

49. What's a hiker's favorite type of music?

Answer: Trail mix!

50. What is an insect's favorite sport?

Answer: Cricket!


